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STATE BANK OF INDIA OFFICERS ASSOCIATION (BENGAL CIRCLE) 
ANNUAL SPORTS MEET- SILIGURI 

HELD ON 16TH FEBRUARY.2020 AT RAMKRISHNA SARADAMANI VIDYAPITH 
 
 
Like every year, the Annual Sports Meet at Siliguri Module, was jointly organised by SBIOA (Bengal Circle) and SBIOA 
Multistate Co-Operative Credit Society Ltd, today at Ramakrishna Saradamani Vidyapith School Ground Siliguri with an 
enthusiastic gathering of more than 200 members. 
 
After the welcome speech from SBIOA (Bengal Circle) Administrative Zonal Committee, Siliguri, the spectacular meet 
was inaugurated by the eminent sports personality, „BANGA RATNA‟, Ms. Bharati Ghosh, a well-known name in the 
table tennis fraternity in North Bengal. The game was preceded by a magnificent colourful march past with marching 
band attended by around 130 participants. It was followed by hoisting of Association Flag, Oath Taking and declaring 
the “Sports is Open” by Com Lakpa Tshering Yolm, Asstt. General Secretary, SBIOA (Bengal Circle), Siliguri Module, 
Com Mithun Dutta, Asst Secretary, SBIOA (Bengal Circle) and Youth Convenor, SBIOA (Bengal Circle) and Apurba 
Kumar Mondal, Central Committee Member, SBIOA (Bengal Circle) and other Guests and  dignitaries. 
 
Sri D.V. Gutte, Dy General Manager (B&O), Siliguri Module and Headmistress of Ramkrishna Saradamoni Vidyapith 
have graced the occasion as the Chief Guest and as the Guest of honour respectively. 
 
About 220 Members, their families and SBIOA Seniors have gathered in the ground with full of zeal, enthusiasm and 
passion. They participated and enjoyed the encouraging endeavour of the Circle Association. For the last 5 years 
members from Siliguri, Raiganj, Silkkim and other hilly areas and also from forest / Doors had been enjoying the 
programme. 
 
There were 19 events in the sports meet, including events for children, lady members, spouse and SBIOA Seniors. All 
the participants‟ enthusiasm and zeal was appreciated by the guests, dignitaries and Judges Team from Siliguri Sports 
Association. The most interesting event was of “Breaking the Jar”, Balance race for Lady Employees and “Tug of War” 
game between members attached with Zonal Office and other members. Ultimately the latter conquered the trophy. 
 
The participants were felicitated by the Hon‟ble Chief Guest, Guest of honour other dignitaries and Leadership of the 
Circle/Module/Region/Units after the event. The Jawans of Salugara BSF Battalion, who extended their helping hands in 
providing tents and other sports materials etc., were also felicitated. 
 
Moreover, at the same venue, a social welfare programme was organised in behoving manner by the Administrative 
Zonal Committee, Siliguri. Four Ceiling fans were handed over to Ramkrishna Saradamoni Vidyapith Scholl authority for 
their class rooms. 
  
The Sports meet finally concluded after a befitting and nice lunch. 
 
  

With revolutionary greetings,             
 
 
 
Shubhajyoti Chattopadhyay 
(General Secretary) 
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